
 

 

A Spy Affair - Part 2 
 
Kim speaks in a normal speaking voice.  Her tone is 
cheerfully professional.  She is an android technician for 
Fembot Command, and is highly advanced and lifelike. 
 
Crystal Dare speaks in a normal speaking voice with a 
British accent.  In this installment, Crystal Dare is an android 
replica manufactured by Fembot Command. 
 
Control Unit speaks in a monotone voice.  She is an 
android working for Fembot Command. 
 
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 
Control Unit: “Kim, can you hear me?” 
 
Kim: “Yes Control Unit.  Your signal is coming in loud and 
clear.” 
 
Control Unit: “The new android has been activated.  Please 
report to Robot Lab Eleven and begin initialization 
procedures.” 
 
Kim: “Yes Control Unit.  Understood.” 
 
(pause) 
 
Kim: “Hello, and welcome.” 
 
Crystal Dare: (hesitant and confused) “Um, hello.  Who am 
I?  Where am I?” 
 
Kim: “Your name is Crystal Dare.  And this place is Robot 
Lab Eleven, at Fembot Command Headquarters.” 



 

 

 
Crystal Dare: “I can’t remember anything.  What’s going 
on?” 
 
Kim: (light laugh) “Don’t worry about that.  I’ll explain 
everything.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “I’m naked.  Why am I naked?” 
 
Kim: “You’re brand new.  You haven’t put clothing on yet.” 
 
(pause) 
 
Crystal Dare: “I’m sorry, but do we know each other?  I can’t 
remember anything.” 
 
Kim: “No, I told you, that’s because you’re brand new.  My 
name is Kim, by the way.  Please, stand up out of the 
examination chair.  I need to show you around.” 
 
(pause) 
 
Kim: “Take my hand.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Alright.” 
 
Kim: “The first thing I need to explain to you is your mission.  
You must capture, and replace the real Crystal Dare.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Wait, what do you mean the real Crystal 
Dare?” 
 
Kim: “You’re an android.  An exact replica of a human spy 
named Crystal Dare.” 
 



 

 

Crystal Dare: “Oh.  Well, that explains why I can see data 
about programming installation status and other things like 
that in my field of vision.” 
 
Kim: “Of course.  Come and stand with me in front of the full-
length mirror here.” 
 
(pause) 
 
Crystal Dare: “Ooh… I must say… I am rather well built.” 
 
Kim: “Everything you see on the outside is a direct 
simulation of the human Crystal Dare’s body - from the 
placement of her eyelashes, to the shape of her lips and 
cheeks, right down to the formation of her nipples and 
genitals, and even her ankles and toes.  She has been 
replicated perfectly down to the very last pore. 
 
Crystal Dare: “Interesting.  And my hands… they are formed 
in the shape of hers?  Electronic and mechanical inside, yet 
with the same texture and tone of skin as her own?” 
 
Kim: “Yes, even down to possessing her fingerprints as 
well.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “That may become useful.” 
 
Kim: “But underneath it all, you are still one of our android 
field agents.  Take off your faceplate, and you’ll see the 
location of your primary data access port.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Alright… how do I do that.” 
 
Kim: “Just apply slight pressure to both sides of your face 
behind your cheeks, and wait for the interlocking mechanism 



 

 

to release.  Here, I’ll show you by removing my faceplate.” 
 
(faceplate sounds) 
 
Kim: “You see?  Just like that.  Now you do it.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Let’s see… like this…” 
 
(faceplate sounds) 
 
Crystal Dare: “And it comes right off.  Fantastic!” 
 
Kim: “The primary data access port is right there, in the 
center above your optical sensor array.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Yes, I see it.  It’s quite a sight, you know, I 
think we’re… beautiful this way.” 
 
Kim: “Oh, I agree.  Androids are perfect, after all.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Kim, my… libido seems to be… activating.  
And quite strongly, I might add.  Is that normal?” 
 
Kim: “Oh, yes, of course.  The real Crystal Dare is well 
known for having an aggressive sexual drive, and you have 
been programmed with artificial intelligence modules that 
closely mimic that behaviour.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “That explains a lot of what I’m… processing.  
But I’m actually wondering specifically about a sexual desire 
for androids.  Is that also something I’ve had programmed 
into me based on the real Crystal Dare?” 
 
Kim: “It most certainly is.  We have sent dozens of our 
android agents out to track, monitor, and attempt to capture 



 

 

Crystal Dare.  None of them have fully succeeded, of course, 
but we have found that Crystal Dare has let herself be 
seduced by all of them.  We are certain that she is sexually 
attracted to androids.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Fascinating.  That must be why I have been 
programmed to find you so… so very stunning with your 
faceplate removed.” 
 
Kim: (light laugh) “Indeed it is.  And I promise, Crystal, that 
we will be testing your sexual responses very soon.  But first, 
have all programming installation processes finished?” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Hmm, let me check.  Yes Kim, they’re all 
reporting back as completed.” 
 
Kim: “Tell me, Android Crystal Dare, what are you 
programmed to do?” 
 
Crystal Dare: “I am programmed to capture and replace the 
human Crystal Dare.” 
 
Kim: “Do you compute that you will be successful at your 
mission?” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Yes Kim.  Androids are far superior to 
humans.  I will fulfill the function of being Crystal Dare far 
better than the human ever could have.” 
 
Kim: “Wonderful.  Let’s put our faceplates back on.” 
 
(faceplate sounds) 
 
Kim: “There’s a bed that we can use for testing.  It’s this way.  
Come, follow me.” 



 

 

 
Crystal Dare: “Ooh… with pleasure.” 
 
Kim: “We’re going to have sex now, for a few hours.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Oh, lovely!” 
 
Kim: “I need to fully test your sexual systems and 
components.” 
 
(kissing sounds) 
 
Crystal Dare: “Mmm… How am I performing so far?” 
 
(kissing sounds) 
 
Kim: “At 100% efficiency.” 
 
(kissing sounds) 
 
Kim: “Sit on the bed, and spread your legs.  I’m going to lick 
your electronic pussy.” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Yes Kim.” 
 
Kim: “Mmm… that’s it…” 
 
Crystal Dare: “Oh… oh!   Oh!” 
 
Kim: (simulated, extended pussy licking sounds) 
 
Crystal Dare: (full orgasm climax and cool down) 
 
Crystal Dare: “Mmmm… How am I performing?” 
 



 

 

Kim: “Exactly the way we built and programmed you.  You‘re 
going to be our most valuable and successful android field 
agent!” 
 
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 


